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Editor’s Note 

Greetings to our readers. After what has been a difficult year, we hope you will find in the pages 
of Volume 44 of our journal a welcome respite as well as renewal to our Unitarian Universalist 
principles and continuing call to purpose.   

We begin by revisiting our 2019 Convocation of UU Studies, featuring the second Collegium 
Scholar Lecture delivered by Mark Harris.  As someone who found a source of identity in sports, 
Mark speaks of his concern that our Unitarian Universalist focus on mental, spiritual, and 
ministerial activity does not overshadow our need for bodily exercise, development, play, and 
mutually loving sexual intimacy.  The latter item can teach us, says Rebecca Parker, that “joy is 
grounded in relational power.”   

J. Sylvan explores developments in UU gay rights history as played out at the Arlington Street 
Church, beginning with a lesbian wedding officiated by Rev. Leslie Westbrook in 1973. Ten 
years later, meeting space at the Arlington Street Church was offered by Rev. Victor Carpenter 
to the North American Man Boy Love Association (NAMBLA), which pushed further what 
Sylvan calls the “edges of moral discomfort.” Sylvan observes that Arlington Street participated 
in the conversations by which gay activists negotiated the moral boundaries of their movement. 
The moral boundaries of sexual engagement continue to be negotiated today, for instance, 
regarding the practice of polyamory. 

Paul Beedle tells the story of Rev. Theodore Clapp, a northern Congregationalist minister who 
was invited in 1835 to serve a newly formed Presbyterian church in New Orleans. Though Clapp 
was a popular preacher, his position in the (Orthodox) Presbytery came to be challenged due to 
perceived conflicts over theology. In time he left the Presbyterian church, and many of his 
parishioners followed him as he established a Universalist congregation. Clapp took care not to 
offend southern honor culture, yet his support for slavery was tempered by a concern that slaves 
be protected from cruelty and neglect. 

Another piece of our Universalist past is brought to light in Deidre Johnson’s account of 
Elizabeth M. Bruce, a mid-nineteenth-century woman who was a minister’s wife, a prolific 
writer, and eventually an ordained Universalist minister in her own right. Elizabeth wrote stories 
that featured children who solve problems for themselves or, in some cases, educate the adults in 
their lives. After her marriage ended, she became editor of a popular children’s periodical, the 
Myrtle. Her one adult novel was dedicated to “the noble band of Christian ministers by whose 
self-sacrificing toil American civilization is so rapidly advancing...” By 1877, she renewed her 
license to preach and built the Wayside Chapel as an addition to her home, where she held 
services for large crowds until she died in 1910.  

The final entries in this year’s journal illuminate fascinating elements of our Transylvanian 
Unitarian past.  Robert Kokenyesi offers translations of two Unitarian sermons delivered in 1597 
by György Enyedi, the Third Bishop of the Transylvanian Unitarian Church at that time. These 
sermons are based on Psalm 2, which was the scriptural text used in Transylvania to support an 
anti-trinitarian theology. The reasoning, as readers will see, began with the recognition that Jesus 


